County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCracken

Email Addresses:
marks@-co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@-co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

MR JUSTIN GUILES CEO

VESTAL ASPHALT

201 STAGE ROAD

VESTAL NY 13850

BID #2023H-3 NAME: LIQUID ASPHALT MATERIALS
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

AWARD: LOW BID TO PRIMARY VENDOR AS HI-LITED.

PURCHASES MAY BE MADE FROM ALTERNATE ONLY IF PRIMARY SOURCE IS NOT AVAILABLE.

Dear Mr. Guiles:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:
\ Purchase Order to be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sinc:e{?ly,

( ""i‘ /.‘ J ) , .
LA \\'//( 1y é((_ .
Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

Enclosure: Wage Rates

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Midland Asphalt Materials, Suit-Kote

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK/AWARD 2023H-3 VESTAL



Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

County of Jefferson
Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591 Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Account Clerk
Amanda McCracken
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

MR BRIAN PEPPER REGIONAL SALES MANAGER MR TIM MCNALLY SENIOR ESTIMATOR

SUIT-KOTE CORPORATION MIDLAND ASPHALT MATERIALS INC
1911 LORINGS CROSSING ROAD 640 YOUNG STREET

CORTLAND NY 13045 TONAWANDA NY 14150

BID #2023H-3 NAME LIQUID ASPHALT MATERIALS

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1,2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

AWARD: LOW BID TO PRIMARY VENDOR AS HI-LITED.
PURCHASES MAY BE MADE FROM ALTERNATE ONLY IF PRIMARY SOURCE IS NOT AVAILABLE.

Dear Mr. Pepper, Mr. McNally:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on
full compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:
V Performance Bond in the Amount of $300,000.00
If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.
Sincerely,

/ { \/‘\,.;’L&,_ pre /‘. ,// }&' [’ ((

4D
Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Directgr/
MS/kd

Enclosure: Wage Rates

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Vestal

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK/AWARD 2023H-3 MIDLAND, SUIT-KOTE



BID #2023h-3

LIQUID ASPHALT MATERIALS
BID TABULATION

2023 BID PRICING

Midland Asphalt Materials Inc.

640 Young Street
Tonawanda, NY 14150

Suit-Kote Corp.
21811 Lane Road
Watertown, NY 13601

Vestal Asphalt
201 Stage Road
Vestal, NY 13850

1. Emulsions

A. Sealing Grades

HFMS-2ST $3.731 $2.980 $3.143
HFMS-2STP $4.001 $3.200 $3.543
CRS-2 $3.711 No Bid 2.8
CRS-2P $3.981 No Bid
HFMS-2H $4.185 $4.164 4.02:
HFRS-2 $3.731  $2560 $2.987
** Tack Coat $10.000  $8.850 No Bid
HFRS-2P $4.001 . e $3.077
AEDC B $2.280 $2.692
** Minimum 30 gal waiting time
after 1 hour
B. Mixing Grades
702-4201 CMS-2 $4.165 No Bid 4.012
702-4301 CMS-2h $4.165 No Bid
702-3401 HFMS-2h $4.185 $4.164
702-3301 HFMS-2 $4.185 $4.164 ; 5
HFMS-2C No Bid $3.980 $4.022
HFMS-2Gh $4.275 $4.242 $4.042
HFRA No Bid $4.000 No Bid
HFMS-2Gws $4.485 $4472 $4.252
2. Equipment
Automated Chipper $2,800.00 $350.00 $2,500.00 $312.50 | $2,300.00 | $360.00
Pneumatic Roller $2,200.00 $300.00 $2,000.00 $250.00 | $2,200.00 | $330.00
Pugmill $3,000.00 $375.00 $2,800.00 $350.00 | $3,000.00 | $450.00
Automated Paver $3,300.00 $400.00 $3,300.00 $412.50 | $3,500.00 | $525.00
Vibratory Roller No Bid No Bid $2,200.00 $275.00 | $2,500.00 | $375.00
Mobilization - To be included in
above pricing
3. 59w Bituminous Stabilized Mix
(FOB Plant) No Bid $46.81 No Bid
DEVIATIONS:
COMMENTS:

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,

SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION

OF BID RESULTSJJ/N LESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
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